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Price Tabulation 
 
 

Item Description 

Guaranteed 

Maximum 

Pricing (GMP) 

 Bartlett Cocke 

General 

Contractors, 

LLC  

 Thos. S. 

Byrne, Inc. dba 

Byrne 

Construction 

Services  

 Cadence 

McShane 

Construction 

LLC  

 D. Wilson 

Construction 

Company  

 Gilbane 

Building 

Company  

 Guido 

Brothers 

Construction 

Company, Inc.  

 Joeris General 

Contractors, Ltd  

 Jordan Foster 

Construction, 

LLC  

 Sabre 

Commercial, 

Inc.   

 Skanska USA 

Building Inc.  

 SpawGlass 

Contractors, Inc.  

 Sundt 

Construction, 

Inc.  

 The NRP 

Group  

 The Trevino 

Group  

 Turner 

Construction 

Company in 

Associateion 

with Straight 

Line 

Management  

 J.T. Vaughn 

Construction, 

LLC  

Northeast Lakeview College $28,100,000.00  $4,287,156.00  $0.00 $0.00 $3,641,979.00 $4,713,702.00  $3,382,000.00  $2,690,877.00  $3,705,715.00  $3,367,000.00 $3,559,959.00  $4,137,677.00  $5,780,668.00  $200,000.00  No Bid $2,107,500.00  $3,383,474.00  

Northwest Vista College $46,200,000.00  $5,586,680.00  $0.00 $4,741,539.00 $0.00 $5,991,569.00  $5,313,000.00  $3,891,696.00  $4,993,500.00  $4,634,000.00 $5,500,725.00  $5,761,753.00  $7,286,820.00  $940,000.00  $1,407,000.00  $3,465,000.00  $5,078,236.00  

Palo Alto College $63,000,000.00  $5,585,312.00  $6,496,742.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,968,988.00  $6,483,500.00  $4,042,618.00  $6,361,377.00  $0.00 $6,237,828.98  $7,088,323.00  $8,450,712.00  $1,222,000.00  $2,740,000.00  $4,725,000.00  $0.00 

Westside Education & Training Center $16,100,000.00  $1,506,415.00  $1,516,129.00 $0.00 $1,803,864.00 $2,376,368.00  $2,081,000.00  $1,223,585.00  $1,575,568.00  $1,477,000.00 $1,490,766.00  $1,859,876.00  $2,689,514.00  No Bid  No Bid  $1,648,000.00  $0.00 

Southeast Education & Training 

Center 
$15,400,000.00  $1,480,090.00  $1,495,129.00 $0.00 $1,803,864.00 $2,376,368.00  $2,022,000.00  $1,199,339.00  $1,570,475.00  $1,428,000.00 $1,467,402.00  $1,824,658.00  $2,647,800.00  $2,362,000.00   No Bid  $1,232,000.00  $0.00 

IH 10 Northwest Education & 

Training Center 
$15,400,000.00  $1,567,459.00  $1,496,503.00 $0.00 $1,803,864.00 $2,376,368.00  $2,022,000.00  $1,149,412.00  $1,570,475.00  $1,428,000.00 $1,446,418.00  $1,824,658.00  $2,647,800.00   No Bid   No Bid  $1,232,000.00  $0.00 

San Antonio College $47,600,000.00  $5,507,742.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,686,929.00  $5,438,000.00  $3,790,908.00  $5,223,006.00  $0.00 $5,300,733.00  $6,046,645.00  $7,658,860.00   No Bid  $2,758,000.00  $3,570,000.00  $5,719,771.00 

First Responders Academy $13,400,000.00  $1,484,624.00  $1,457,161.00 $0.00 $1,543,427.75 $2,279,143.00  $1,897,000.00  $1,063,811.00  $1,433,495.00  $1,288,000.00 $1,279,841.00  $1,667,232.00  $2,523,574.00   No Bid  $0.00 $1,072,000.00  $0.00 

St. Philip's College - MLK Campus $41,500,000.00  $4,929,015.00  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,808,469.00  $5,155,000.00  $3,590,429.00  $4,691,633.00  $4,305,000.00  $4,536,914.00  $5,347,370.00  $6,978,148.00   No Bid  $1,474,000.00  $3,112,500.00  $0.00 

St. Philip's College - Southwest 

Campus $13,400,000.00  $1,371,033.00  $1,421,048.00 $0.00 $1,543,427.75 $2,279,143.00  $1,897,000.00  $1,063,811.00  $1,479,401.00  $1,288,000.00  $1,452,673.00  $1,666,232.00  $2,523,574.00   No Bid   No Bid  $1,072,000.00  $0.00 

Offeror’s total of the  

 campus/location(s) proposed $300,100,000.00  $33,305,526.00  $13,882,712.00 $4,741,539.00 $12,140,426.50 $39,857,047.00  $35,690,500.00  $23,706,486.00  $32,604,645.00  $19,215,000.00  $32,273,259.98  $37,224,424.00  $49,187,470.00   No Bid   No Bid  $23,236,000.00  $14,181,481.00  

GMP amount of Offeror’s  

proposal campus/location    $300,100,000.00 $136,700,000.00 $46,200,000.00 $101,800,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $189,500,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $300,100,000.00 $300,100,000.00 

Not Ranked  Not Ranked  

$300,100,000.00  $121,900,000.00  

Percentage of the GMP    11.10% 10.16% 10.26% 11.93% 13.28% 11.89% 7.90% 10.86% 10.14% 10.75% 12.40% 16.39% 7.74% 11.63% 

Price Rank   8 4 5 11 13 10 2 7 3 6 12 14 1 9 

Technical Rank   4 8 13 12 10 6 5 11 14 1 3 9 7 2 

Overall Rank    4 7 13 12 10 8 5 11 14 1 3 9 6 2 

                            
    

    

Notes:               
  

  

1. Price was evaluated using percentage of GMP for the proposed campus/location.          
  

  
2.  The proposal submitted by the NRP Group failed to meet the CSP minimum qualifications and was not ranked.              
3.  The Trevino Group did not include proposed pricing for all components of the college/location and was not ranked.  

4.  Offerors submitting a no bid are shown as No Bid or $0.            

 




